
PAINTING 
WORKSHOP

PREPARING PAINTING PROFESSIONALS



   Workshop Objective

This program provides a complete 
introduction to the trade of 
painting. Our program features 
a technical class combined with 
on-the-job training, which allows 
us to transform participants from 
beginners to skilled professionals. 
Participants will learn about the 
career opportunities as well as the 
basic skills and safety equipment 
needed.

  Contact Us

info@craftandtradeacademy.org

3100 International Airport Dr. 
Suite 600, Charlotte, NC 28208

+1 (704) 247 6823

              Workshop Overview

We want to maintain the highest 
industry standards that is why we 
offer a comprehensive training 
program designed to teach the 
essentials of painting. Participants 
will learn how to prepare a surface 
for painting, seal cracks, deal 
with moisture, proper primer 
application, choose the right type 
of paint for different conditions 
and temperatures, choose and mix 
paint colors, secure and prepare 
the painting site and achieve 
different effects and use various 
finishes and glazes.
 

   Participants

Professionals and apprenticeship 
students that are interested in 
developing painting skills. 

   Program Dates

February 22nd and 23rd, 2023
July 11th and 12th, 2023

craftandtradeacademy.org


